



**Snohomish County**  
Purchasing Division

**Bid # 061-15SB**  
**White Boards, Interactive**  
**7/28/2015**

**Preliminary Results of Bid Opening:**

<b>Item #</b>	<b>Schedule 1 – Description</b>	<b>Connectecs</b>	<b>B &amp; H</b>	<b>Sharp</b>	<b>Advanced Classroom Tech.</b>
1.	Display – 60”	\$3,975.00	\$4,738.00	\$3,971.00	\$4,199.00
2.	Display – 70”	\$4,975.00	\$5,459.00	\$3,839.00	\$5,074.00
3.	Display – 80”	\$8,995.00	\$8,571.59	\$8,778.00	\$8,849.00
4.	Touch Application Pad	\$400.00	\$360.00	\$385.00	No Bid
	<b>Schedule 2 – Description</b>				
1.	Whiteboard – 89”	No Bid	\$1,242.00	No Bid	No Bid
2.	Whiteboard – 77”	No Bid	\$911.00	No Bid	No Bid