

**SCHEDULE A**

Items	Est Qty	UOM	Acme Supply		Washington State Correctional Industries		Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc.		Bob Barker Company, Inc.		ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.		Comade, Inc.		Charm-Tex	
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
<b>ITEM 1 - Green Striped Uniform Top</b>																
a. Small	75	Each	\$5.50	\$412.50	\$4.05	\$303.75	\$4.59	\$344.25	\$4.69	\$351.75	\$6.14	\$460.50	\$7.25	\$543.75	\$5.54	\$415.50
b. Medium	180	Each	\$5.50	\$990.00	\$4.05	\$729.00	\$4.59	\$826.20	\$4.69	\$844.20	\$6.14	\$1,105.20	\$7.25	\$1,305.00	\$5.54	\$997.20
c. Large	300	Each	\$5.50	\$1,650.00	\$4.05	\$1,215.00	\$4.59	\$1,377.00	\$4.69	\$1,407.00	\$6.14	\$1,842.00	\$7.25	\$2,175.00	\$5.54	\$1,662.00
d. Extra Large	177	Each	\$5.50	\$973.50	\$4.05	\$716.85	\$4.59	\$812.43	\$4.69	\$830.13	\$6.14	\$1,086.78	\$7.25	\$1,283.25	\$5.54	\$980.58
f. 2X Large	125	Each	\$5.50	\$687.50	\$6.05	\$756.25	\$4.59	\$573.75	\$4.79	\$598.75	\$6.14	\$767.50	\$7.25	\$906.25	\$5.54	\$692.50
g. 3X Large	95	Each	\$5.50	\$522.50	\$6.05	\$574.75	\$4.82	\$457.90	\$4.79	\$455.05	\$6.14	\$583.30	\$7.85	\$745.75	\$5.90	\$560.50
h. 4X Large	50	Each	\$5.50	\$275.00	\$6.05	\$302.50	\$4.82	\$241.00	\$4.79	\$239.50	\$6.73	\$336.50	\$7.85	\$392.50	\$5.90	\$295.00
i. 5X Large	28	Each	\$5.50	\$154.00	\$6.05	\$169.40	\$5.06	\$141.68	\$4.79	\$134.12	\$7.39	\$206.92	\$8.65	\$242.20	\$6.18	\$173.04
j. 6X Large	6	Each	\$5.50	\$33.00	\$6.05	\$36.30	\$5.06	\$30.36	\$4.79	\$28.74	\$8.01	\$48.06	\$8.65	\$51.90	\$6.54	\$39.24
k. 7X Large	2	Each	\$6.00	\$12.00	\$7.05	\$14.10	\$5.31	\$10.62	\$6.63	\$13.26	\$8.64	\$17.28	\$9.70	\$19.40	\$6.90	\$13.80
l. 8X Large	5	Each	\$6.00	\$30.00	\$7.05	\$35.25	\$5.31	\$26.55	\$6.63	\$33.15	\$9.26	\$46.30	\$9.70	\$48.50	\$6.90	\$34.50
j. 10X Large	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$7.05	\$7.05	\$5.60	\$5.60	\$6.71	\$6.71	\$10.51	\$10.51	\$10.75	\$10.75	\$6.90	\$6.90
<b>SUBTOTAL</b>				\$5,746.00		\$4,860.20		\$4,847.34		\$4,942.36		\$6,510.85		\$7,724.25		\$5,870.76

\$4,957.21

Items	Est Qty	UOM	Acme Supply		Washington State Correctional Industries		Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc.		Bob Barker Company, Inc.		ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.		Comade, Inc.		Charm-Tex	
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
<b>ITEM 2 - Red Uniform Top</b>																
a. Small	15	Each	\$5.50	\$82.50	\$4.40	\$66.00	\$4.59	\$68.85	\$4.69	\$70.35	\$6.14	\$92.10	\$5.00	\$75.00	\$5.54	\$83.10
b. Medium	75	Each	\$5.50	\$412.50	\$4.40	\$330.00	\$4.59	\$344.25	\$4.69	\$351.75	\$6.14	\$460.50	\$5.00	\$375.00	\$5.54	\$415.50
c. Large	100	Each	\$5.50	\$550.00	\$4.40	\$440.00	\$4.59	\$459.00	\$4.69	\$469.00	\$6.14	\$614.00	\$5.00	\$500.00	\$5.54	\$554.00
d. Extra Large	50	Each	\$5.50	\$275.00	\$4.40	\$220.00	\$4.59	\$229.50	\$4.69	\$234.50	\$6.14	\$307.00	\$5.00	\$250.00	\$5.54	\$277.00
f. 2X Large	45	Each	\$5.50	\$247.50	\$5.40	\$243.00	\$4.59	\$206.55	\$4.79	\$215.55	\$6.14	\$276.30	\$5.00	\$225.00	\$5.54	\$249.30
g. 3X Large	55	Each	\$5.50	\$302.50	\$5.40	\$297.00	\$4.82	\$265.10	\$4.79	\$263.45	\$6.14	\$337.70	\$5.55	\$305.25	\$5.90	\$324.50
h. 4X Large	38	Each	\$5.50	\$209.00	\$5.40	\$205.20	\$4.82	\$183.16	\$4.79	\$182.02	\$6.73	\$255.74	\$5.55	\$210.90	\$5.90	\$224.20
i. 5X Large	1	Each	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$5.40	\$5.40	\$5.06	\$5.06	\$4.79	\$4.79	\$7.39	\$7.39	\$6.25	\$6.25	\$6.18	\$6.18
j. 6X Large	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$5.40	\$5.40	\$5.06	\$5.06	\$4.79	\$4.79	\$8.01	\$8.01	\$6.25	\$6.25	\$6.54	\$6.54
k. 7X Large	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$6.90	\$6.90	\$5.31	\$5.31	\$6.63	\$6.63	\$8.64	\$8.64	\$6.85	\$6.85	\$6.90	\$6.90
l. 8X Large	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$6.90	\$6.90	\$5.31	\$5.31	\$6.63	\$6.63	\$9.26	\$9.26	\$6.85	\$6.85	\$6.90	\$6.90
j. 10X Large	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$6.90	\$6.90	\$5.60	\$5.60	\$6.71	\$6.71	\$10.51	\$10.51	\$7.65	\$7.65	\$6.90	\$6.90
<b>SUBTOTAL</b>				\$2,108.50		\$1,832.70		\$1,782.75		\$1,816.17		\$2,387.15		\$1,975.00		\$2,161.02

\$1,860.72

Items	Est Qty	UOM	Acme Supply		Washington State Correctional Industries		Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc.		Bob Barker Company, Inc.		ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.		Comade, Inc.		Charm-Tex	
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
<b>ITEM 3 - Orange Uniform Top with Screen Print</b>																
a. Small	6	Each	\$5.50	\$33.00	\$4.40	\$26.40	\$5.00	\$30.00	\$4.69	\$28.14	\$7.58	\$45.48	\$5.55	\$33.30	\$5.72	\$34.32
b. Medium	10	Each	\$5.50	\$55.00	\$4.40	\$44.00	\$5.00	\$50.00	\$4.69	\$46.90	\$7.58	\$75.80	\$5.55	\$55.50	\$5.72	\$57.20
c. Large	1	Each	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$4.40	\$4.40	\$5.00	\$5.00	\$4.69	\$4.69	\$7.58	\$7.58	\$5.55	\$5.55	\$5.72	\$5.72
d. Extra Large	5	Each	\$5.50	\$27.50	\$4.40	\$22.00	\$5.00	\$25.00	\$4.69	\$23.45	\$7.58	\$37.90	\$5.55	\$27.75	\$5.72	\$28.60
f. 2X Large	8	Each	\$5.50	\$44.00	\$5.40	\$43.20	\$5.00	\$40.00	\$4.79	\$38.32	\$7.58	\$60.64	\$5.55	\$44.40	\$5.72	\$45.76
g. 3X Large	1	Each	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$5.40	\$5.40	\$5.25	\$5.25	\$4.79	\$4.79	\$7.58	\$7.58	\$6.25	\$6.25	\$6.18	\$6.18
h. 4X Large	2	Each	\$5.50	\$11.00	\$5.40	\$10.80	\$5.25	\$10.50	\$4.79	\$9.58	\$8.20	\$16.40	\$6.25	\$12.50	\$6.18	\$12.36
i. 5X Large	2	Each	\$5.50	\$11.00	\$5.40	\$10.80	\$5.51	\$11.02	\$4.79	\$9.58	\$8.83	\$17.66	\$6.85	\$13.70	\$6.36	\$12.72
j. 6X Large	1	Each	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$5.40	\$5.40	\$5.51	\$5.51	\$4.79	\$4.79	\$9.45	\$9.45	\$6.85	\$6.85	\$6.72	\$6.72
k. 7X Large	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$6.90	\$6.90	\$5.78	\$5.78	\$6.63	\$6.63	\$10.08	\$10.08	\$7.65	\$7.65	\$7.18	\$7.18
l. 8X Large	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$6.90	\$6.90	\$5.78	\$5.78	\$6.63	\$6.63	\$10.70	\$10.70	\$7.65	\$7.65	\$7.18	\$7.18
j. 10X Large	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$6.90	\$6.90	\$6.10	\$6.10	\$6.71	\$6.71	\$11.95	\$11.95	\$8.45	\$8.45	\$7.18	\$7.18
<b>SUBTOTAL</b>				\$216.00		\$193.10		\$199.94		\$190.21		\$311.22		\$229.55		\$231.12

\$1,138.63

Items	Est Qty	UOM	Acme Supply		Washington State Correctional Industries		Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc.		Bob Barker Company, Inc.		ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.		Comade, Inc.		Charm-Tex	
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price
<b>ITEM 4 - Khaki Uniform Top with Screen Print</b>																
a. Small	1	Each	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$4.40	\$4.40	\$4.64	\$4.64	\$4.69	\$4.69	\$7.58	\$7.58	\$5.55	\$5.55	\$5.72	\$5.72
b. Medium	1	Each	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$4.40	\$4.40	\$4.64	\$4.64	\$4.69	\$4.69	\$7.58	\$7.58	\$5.55	\$5.55	\$5.72	\$5.72
c. Large	50	Each	\$5.50	\$275.00	\$4.40	\$220.00	\$4.64	\$232.00	\$4.69	\$234.50	\$7.58	\$379.00	\$5.55	\$277.50	\$5.72	\$286.00
d. Extra Large	50	Each	\$5.50	\$275.00	\$4.40	\$220.00	\$4.64	\$232.00	\$4.69	\$234.50	\$7.58	\$379.00	\$5.55	\$277.50	\$5.72	\$286.00
f. 2X Large	50	Each	\$5.50	\$275.00	\$5.40	\$270.00	\$4.64	\$232.00	\$4.79	\$239.50	\$7.58	\$379.00	\$5.55	\$277.50	\$5.72	\$286.00
g. 3X Large	1	Each	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$5.40	\$5.40	\$4.87	\$4.87	\$4.79	\$4.79	\$7.58	\$7.58	\$6.25	\$6.25	\$6.18	\$6.18
h. 4X Large	1	Each	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$5.40	\$5.40	\$4.87	\$4.87	\$4.79	\$4.79	\$8.20	\$8.20	\$6.25	\$6.25	\$6.18	\$6.18
i. 5X Large	1	Each	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$5.40	\$5.40	\$5.12	\$5.12	\$4.79	\$4.79	\$8.83	\$8.83	\$6.85	\$6.85	\$6.36	\$6.36
j. 6X Large	1	Each	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$5.40	\$5.40	\$5.12	\$5.12	\$4.79	\$4.79	\$9.45	\$9.45	\$6.85	\$6.85	\$6.72	\$6.72

k.	7X Large	6	Each	\$6.00	\$36.00	\$6.90	\$41.40	\$5.40	\$32.40	\$6.63	\$39.78	\$10.08	\$60.48	\$7.65	\$45.90	\$7.18	\$43.08
l.	8X Large	3	Each	\$6.00	\$18.00	\$6.90	\$20.70	\$5.40	\$16.20	\$6.63	\$19.89	\$10.70	\$32.10	\$7.65	\$22.95	\$7.18	\$21.54
j.	10X Large	3	Each	\$6.00	\$18.00	\$6.90	\$20.70	\$5.65	\$16.95	\$6.71	\$20.13	\$11.95	\$35.85	\$8.45	\$25.35	\$7.18	\$21.54
<b>SUBTOTAL</b>					\$930.00		\$823.20		\$790.81		\$816.84		\$1,314.65		\$964.00		\$981.04

Items	Est Qty	UOM	Acme Supply		Washington State Correctional Industries		Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc.		Bob Barker Company, Inc.		ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.		Comade, Inc.		Charm-Tex		
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	
<b>ITEM 5a - Green Uniform Pant</b>																	
a.	Small	89	Each	\$6.00	\$534.00	\$4.90	\$436.10	\$5.88	\$523.32	\$5.83	\$518.87	\$6.89	\$613.21	\$5.95	\$529.55	\$5.90	\$525.10
b.	Medium	270	Each	\$6.00	\$1,620.00	\$4.90	\$1,323.00	\$5.88	\$1,587.60	\$6.76	\$1,825.20	\$6.89	\$1,860.30	\$5.95	\$1,606.50	\$6.18	\$1,668.60
c.	Large	363	Each	\$6.00	\$2,178.00	\$4.90	\$1,778.70	\$5.88	\$2,134.44	\$6.76	\$2,453.88	\$6.89	\$2,501.07	\$5.95	\$2,159.85	\$6.18	\$2,243.34
d.	Extra Large	238	Each	\$6.00	\$1,428.00	\$4.90	\$1,166.20	\$5.88	\$1,399.44	\$7.37	\$1,754.06	\$6.89	\$1,639.82	\$5.95	\$1,416.10	\$6.18	\$1,470.84
f.	2X Large	263	Each	\$6.00	\$1,578.00	\$5.50	\$1,446.50	\$5.88	\$1,546.44	\$7.37	\$1,938.31	\$6.89	\$1,812.07	\$5.95	\$1,564.85	\$6.18	\$1,625.34
g.	3X Large	165	Each	\$6.00	\$990.00	\$5.50	\$907.50	\$6.17	\$1,018.05	\$7.48	\$1,234.20	\$6.89	\$1,136.85	\$6.65	\$1,097.25	\$6.36	\$1,049.40
h.	4X Large	50	Each	\$6.00	\$300.00	\$5.50	\$275.00	\$6.17	\$308.50	\$8.26	\$413.00	\$7.51	\$375.50	\$6.65	\$332.50	\$6.54	\$327.00
i.	5X Large	30	Each	\$6.00	\$180.00	\$5.50	\$165.00	\$6.50	\$195.00	\$8.80	\$264.00	\$8.14	\$244.20	\$7.45	\$223.50	\$6.90	\$207.00
j.	6X Large	12	Each	\$6.00	\$72.00	\$5.50	\$66.00	\$6.50	\$78.00	\$9.27	\$111.24	\$8.76	\$105.12	\$7.45	\$89.40	\$6.90	\$82.80
k.	7X Large	1	Each	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$6.83	\$6.83	\$9.27	\$9.27	\$9.39	\$9.39	\$8.15	\$8.15	\$7.54	\$7.54
l.	8X Large	1	Each	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$6.83	\$6.83	\$9.71	\$9.71	\$10.01	\$10.01	\$8.15	\$8.15	\$7.54	\$7.54
j.	10X Large	1	Each	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$7.17	\$7.17	\$10.16	\$10.16	\$11.26	\$11.26	\$9.15	\$9.15	\$7.90	\$7.90
<b>SUBTOTAL</b>					\$8,901.00		\$7,583.50		\$8,811.62		\$10,541.90		\$10,318.80		\$9,044.95		\$9,222.40

Items	Est Qty	UOM	Acme Supply		Washington State Correctional Industries		Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc.		Bob Barker Company, Inc.		ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.		Comade, Inc.		Charm-Tex		
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	
<b>ITEM 5b - Red Uniform Pant</b>																	
a.	Small	13	Each	\$6.00	\$78.00	\$4.90	\$63.70	\$5.88	\$76.44	\$5.69	\$73.97	\$6.89	\$89.57	\$5.95	\$77.35	\$5.90	\$76.70
b.	Medium	63	Each	\$6.00	\$378.00	\$4.90	\$308.70	\$5.88	\$370.44	\$5.69	\$358.47	\$6.89	\$434.07	\$5.95	\$374.85	\$6.18	\$389.34
c.	Large	75	Each	\$6.00	\$450.00	\$4.90	\$367.50	\$5.88	\$441.00	\$5.69	\$426.75	\$6.89	\$516.75	\$5.95	\$446.25	\$6.18	\$463.50
d.	Extra Large	113	Each	\$6.00	\$678.00	\$4.90	\$553.70	\$5.88	\$664.44	\$5.69	\$642.97	\$6.89	\$778.57	\$5.95	\$672.35	\$6.18	\$698.34
f.	2X Large	50	Each	\$6.00	\$300.00	\$5.50	\$275.00	\$5.88	\$294.00	\$5.69	\$284.50	\$6.89	\$344.50	\$5.95	\$297.50	\$6.18	\$309.00
g.	3X Large	35	Each	\$6.00	\$210.00	\$5.50	\$192.50	\$6.17	\$215.95	\$5.69	\$199.15	\$6.89	\$241.15	\$6.65	\$232.75	\$6.36	\$222.60
h.	4X Large	18	Each	\$6.00	\$108.00	\$5.50	\$99.00	\$6.17	\$111.06	\$5.73	\$103.14	\$7.51	\$135.18	\$6.65	\$119.70	\$6.54	\$117.72
i.	5X Large	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$5.73	\$5.73	\$8.14	\$8.14	\$7.45	\$7.45	\$6.90	\$6.90
j.	6X Large	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$5.99	\$5.99	\$8.76	\$8.76	\$7.45	\$7.45	\$6.90	\$6.90
k.	7X Large	1	Each	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$6.83	\$6.83	\$8.19	\$8.19	\$9.39	\$9.39	\$8.15	\$8.15	\$7.54	\$7.54
l.	8X Large	1	Each	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$6.83	\$6.83	\$8.19	\$8.19	\$10.01	\$10.01	\$8.15	\$8.15	\$7.54	\$7.54
j.	10X Large	1	Each	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$7.17	\$7.17	\$8.19	\$8.19	\$11.26	\$11.26	\$9.15	\$9.15	\$7.90	\$7.90
<b>SUBTOTAL</b>					\$2,235.00		\$1,890.60		\$2,207.16		\$2,125.24		\$2,587.35		\$2,261.10		\$2,313.98

Items	Est Qty	UOM	Acme Supply		Washington State Correctional Industries		Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc.		Bob Barker Company, Inc.		ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.		Comade, Inc.		Charm-Tex		
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	
<b>ITEM 5c - Orange Uniform Pant</b>																	
a.	Small	9	Each	\$6.00	\$54.00	\$4.90	\$44.10	\$5.88	\$52.92	\$5.69	\$51.21	\$6.89	\$62.01	\$5.95	\$53.55	\$5.90	\$53.10
b.	Medium	3	Each	\$6.00	\$18.00	\$4.90	\$14.70	\$5.88	\$17.64	\$5.69	\$17.07	\$6.89	\$20.67	\$5.95	\$17.85	\$6.18	\$18.54
c.	Large	7	Each	\$6.00	\$42.00	\$4.90	\$34.30	\$5.88	\$41.16	\$5.69	\$39.83	\$6.89	\$48.23	\$5.95	\$41.65	\$6.18	\$43.26
d.	Extra Large	14	Each	\$6.00	\$84.00	\$4.90	\$68.60	\$5.88	\$82.32	\$5.69	\$79.66	\$6.89	\$96.46	\$5.95	\$83.30	\$6.18	\$86.52
f.	2X Large	3	Each	\$6.00	\$18.00	\$5.50	\$16.50	\$5.88	\$17.64	\$5.69	\$17.07	\$6.89	\$20.67	\$5.95	\$17.85	\$6.18	\$18.54
g.	3X Large	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$6.17	\$6.17	\$5.69	\$5.69	\$6.89	\$6.89	\$6.65	\$6.65	\$6.36	\$6.36
h.	4X Large	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$6.17	\$6.17	\$5.73	\$5.73	\$7.51	\$7.51	\$6.65	\$6.65	\$6.54	\$6.54
i.	5X Large	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$5.73	\$5.73	\$8.14	\$8.14	\$7.45	\$7.45	\$6.90	\$6.90
j.	6X Large	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$5.99	\$5.99	\$8.76	\$8.76	\$7.45	\$7.45	\$6.90	\$6.90
k.	7X Large	1	Each	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$6.83	\$6.83	\$8.19	\$8.19	\$9.39	\$9.39	\$8.15	\$8.15	\$7.54	\$7.54
l.	8X Large	1	Each	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$6.83	\$6.83	\$8.19	\$8.19	\$10.01	\$10.01	\$8.15	\$8.15	\$7.54	\$7.54
j.	10X Large	1	Each	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$7.17	\$7.17	\$8.19	\$8.19	\$11.76	\$11.76	\$9.15	\$9.15	\$7.90	\$7.90
<b>SUBTOTAL</b>					\$261.00		\$219.70		\$257.85		\$252.55		\$310.50		\$267.85		\$269.64

Items	Est Qty	UOM	Acme Supply		Washington State Correctional Industries		Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc.		Bob Barker Company, Inc.		ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.		Comade, Inc.		Charm-Tex		
			Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	
<b>ITEM 5d - Khaki Uniform Pant</b>																	
a.	Small	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$4.90	\$4.90	\$5.37	\$5.37	\$5.69	\$5.69	\$6.89	\$6.89	\$5.95	\$5.95	\$5.90	\$5.90
b.	Medium	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$4.90	\$4.90	\$5.37	\$5.37	\$5.69	\$5.69	\$6.89	\$6.89	\$5.95	\$5.95	\$6.18	\$6.18
c.	Large	12	Each	\$6.00	\$72.00	\$4.90	\$58.80	\$5.37	\$64.44	\$5.69	\$68.28	\$6.89	\$82.68	\$5.95	\$71.40	\$6.18	\$74.16
d.	Extra Large	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$4.90	\$4.90	\$5.37	\$5.37	\$5.69	\$5.69	\$6.89	\$6.89	\$5.95	\$5.95	\$6.18	\$6.18
f.	2X Large	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$5.37	\$5.37	\$5.69	\$5.69	\$6.89	\$6.89	\$5.95	\$5.95	\$6.18	\$6.18
g.	3X Large	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$5.65	\$5.65	\$5.69	\$5.69	\$6.89	\$6.89	\$6.65	\$6.65	\$6.36	\$6.36
h.	4X Large	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$5.65	\$5.65	\$5.73	\$5.73	\$7.51	\$7.51	\$6.65	\$6.65	\$6.54	\$6.54
i.	5X Large	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$5.95	\$5.95	\$5.73	\$5.73	\$8.14	\$8.14	\$7.45	\$7.45	\$6.90	\$6.90

j.	6X Large	1	Each	\$6.00	\$6.00	\$5.50	\$5.50	\$5.95	\$5.95	\$5.99	\$5.99	\$8.76	\$8.76	\$7.45	\$7.45	\$6.90	\$6.90
k.	7X Large	1	Each	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$6.25	\$6.25	\$8.19	\$8.19	\$9.39	\$9.39	\$8.15	\$8.15	\$7.54	\$7.54
l.	8X Large	1	Each	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$6.25	\$6.25	\$8.19	\$8.19	\$10.01	\$10.01	\$8.15	\$8.15	\$7.54	\$7.54
j.	10X Large	1	Each	\$7.00	\$7.00	\$6.50	\$6.50	\$6.55	\$6.55	\$8.19	\$8.19	\$11.76	\$11.76	\$9.15	\$9.15	\$7.90	\$7.90
<b>SUBTOTAL</b>					\$141.00		\$120.50		\$128.17		\$138.75		\$172.70		\$148.85		\$148.28
<b>ITEMS 1-5d TOTAL</b>					<b>\$20,538.50</b>		<b>\$17,523.50</b>		<b>\$19,025.64</b>		<b>\$20,824.02</b>		<b>\$23,913.22</b>		<b>\$22,615.55</b>		<b>\$20,818.84</b>
<b>BALANCE OF LINE DISCOUNT</b>																	

SCHEDULE B		Est Qty	UOM	Acme Supply		Washington State Correctional Industries		Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc.		Bob Barker Company, Inc.		ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.		Comade, Inc.		Charm-Tex		
Items				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price
<b>ITEM 6 - Suicide Prevention Smock</b>																		
	One Size	16	Each	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$72.53	\$1,160.48	\$102.47	\$1,639.52	\$105.00	\$1,680.00	\$69.90	\$1,118.40	
<b>SUBTOTAL</b>											\$1,160.48		\$1,639.52		\$1,680.00		\$1,118.40	

SCHEDULE B		Est Qty	UOM	Acme Supply		Washington State Correctional Industries		Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc.		Bob Barker Company, Inc.		ICS Jail Supplies, Inc.		Comade, Inc.		Charm-Tex		
Items				Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price	Extended Price	Unit Price
<b>ITEM 7 - Suicide Prevention Blanket</b>																		
	One Size	10	Each	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$69.00	\$690.00	\$85.22	\$852.20	\$85.00	\$850.00	\$69.90	\$690.00	
<b>SUBTOTAL</b>											\$690.00		\$852.20		\$850.00		\$690.00	

<b>ITEMS 6-7 TOTAL</b>				<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>NO BID</b>	<b>\$1,850.48</b>	<b>\$2,491.72</b>	<b>\$2,530.00</b>	<b>\$1,808.40</b>
------------------------	--	--	--	---------------	---------------	---------------	---------------	---------------	---------------	-------------------	-------------------	-------------------	-------------------

<b>PROMPT PAYMENT DISCOUNT</b>	<b>0.00%</b>	<b>0.00%</b>	<b>0.00%</b>	<b>0.00%</b>	<b>0.00%</b>	<b>0.00%</b>	<b>0.00%</b>
<b>BALANCE OF LINE DISCOUNT</b>	<b>0.00%</b>	<b>0.00%</b>	<b>0.00%</b>	<b>0.00%</b>	<b>0.00%</b>	<b>0.00%</b>	<b>0.00%</b>
<b>SCHEDULE A DELIVERY LEAD TIME</b>	<b>30 Days</b>	<b>90 Days*/30 Days</b>	<b>30 Days</b>	<b>ITEM 5a 45-60 Days</b>	<b>30-60 Days</b>	<b>10-14 Days</b>	<b>Shirts - 75 Days**</b>
<b>SCHEDULE B DELIVERY LEAD TIME</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>OTHERS 15-30 Days</b>	<b>3-5 Days</b>	<b>14-21 Days</b>	<b>Pants 7-30 Days</b>
<b>VOLUME DISCOUNT</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>N/A</b>
<b>MINIMUM PURCHASE REQUIREMENTS</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>One Dozen</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>N/A</b>	<b>Prefer per Dozen</b>	<b>\$750.00</b>
<b>SIZING CHART INCLUDED</b>	<b>Yes</b>	<b>Yes</b>	<b>Yes</b>	<b>No</b>	<b>Yes</b>	<b>Yes</b>	<b>No</b>

\* Initial Order

Indicates incorrect extended subtotal submitted with bid proposal. Corrected subtotals used for final calculations.

\*\* Shirts are considered 'custom' because we request no pocket.